
In 1625, Charles went to war
with Spain and lost.

In 1629, Charles sent all the MP's
out of Parliament for 11 years and
ruled on his own because they
wouldn’t allow him to tax people

more.

In 1628, Charles went to war with
the French and lost.

Many in England feared that
Charles favoured the Catholics
too much - after all, he was

married to a Catholic.

Charles firmly believed in the
Divine rights of kings and that it
was his right to run the country as

he wished

1642 - Charles forced his way into
the House of Commons but failed

to arrest 5 leading MPs.

Charles spent a great deal of
money on works of art by
Rubens and Van Dyck.

In 1626, Parliament refused to
raise money for Charles.

In 1640, Charles fought a war
against the Scottish and lost. He
had to pay the Scots to leave

England

1635 - Charles used fines and
ship tax to raise money without
Parliament’s agreement. The

people were very angry.

1626 - Charles decorates English
churches like Catholic ones.

People think he’s trying to change
their religion

1637 - Archbishop Laud
introduced a new prayer book to
Scotland, and some Scottish

people attacked England because
they hated it so much.




